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PLAY AREA LAYOUT: Option 1:

Play Equipment 
for ages 5-12 

2,890 sf

Central 
Activity Zone

Art/Garden/Water

Play Equipment 
for ages 2-5

1,368 sf

Swings
1,644 sf

N0 5 10 20

Picnic slabs and grill area re-
main but replaced with new 
concrete

Enlarged picnic space for two 
tables
New concrete pathways start 
here, using exis  ng entries 
from the sidewalk

New concrete pathways start 
here, using exis  ng entries 
from the sidewalk

Parking lot is removed to cre-
ate an open lawn space for 
play and running around

New shade tree and garden 
space

A central shared paved space 
adds sea  ng areas and a fo-
cal point for art, gardens, or a 
water feature

Perimeter fence is added to 
enclose the lawn area

Hillside is reseeded and re-
graded and replanted for ero-
sion control

Parts of the exis  ng play con-
tainer may be reused to save 
project costs

SignDrinking
Fountain



Project Manager:  Anne Gardner
Contact: 651-266- 6421
Email: Anne.Gardner@ci.stpaul.mn.us D e c e m b e r  1 4 ,  2 0 1 6

J IMMY LEE  PLAY AREA PLAY AREAJJJ IMMY LEEJ IMMY LEE
concept plan

TOWER CLIMBER (option 1):
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SKYWALK (option 1): 
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SKYRISE CLIMBER (option 1):

ST. PAUL, MN

7215 Wellington Rd 86
Wallenstein, ON  N0B 2S0

L

T. 519.669.2972
TF. 1.877.269.2972

F. 519.669.5085
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earthscapeplay.com 
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PLAY AREA LAYOUT: Option 2:

N0 5 10 20

Play Equipment 
for ages 5-12 

3,359 sf

Central 
Activity Zone

Art/Garden/Water

Play 
Equipment 

for ages 2-5
1,319 sf

Swings
1,288 sf

Picnic slabs and grill area re-
main but replaced with new 
concrete

Enlarged picnic space for two 
tables

New bench sea  ng area

New concrete pathways curve 
adn wind through the site cre-
a  ng opportuni  es for ‘Loop-
ing’

Earth mound for play: Rolling, 
jumping, sledding, viewing Drinking

Fountain

Parking lot is removed to cre-
ate an open lawn space for 
play and running around

Sign

A central shared paved space 
adds sea  ng areas and a fo-
cal point for art, gardens, or a 
water feature

Area for embankment slide

Perimeter fence is added to 
enclose the lawn area
Hillside is reseeded and re-
graded and replanted for ero-
sion control

The play area con  ner is en-
 rely new
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TOWER HUT 2 (option 2):
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ART OPTIONS:


